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Drake is back in town after six months of abandoning his new wife, Sasha, whom he believed slept with his
best friend. Clearly, Sasha and Drake are still madly in love with each other, but Sasha is filled with
resentment and gives Drake a hard time, despite his efforts to reconcile. Meanwhile, Elder John is threatened
by Drake’s presence in Devin’s Cay. Drake is favored by the people of El Shaddai Ministries and is expected
to succeed the late Rev. T G Henderson as the next bishop. But Elder John would not have it to be so. He
enlists the aid of his daughter and hatches a sinister plan to dispose of the up and coming young minister. In
the midst of this ecclesiastical chaos, Sasha’s friend, Hunter Rose and Drake’s brother, Kevin Beckford, are
brought together by circumstance and find themselves incredibly attracted to each other. But there is often a
stigma attached to interracial dating – definitely in society and perhaps within Kevin, as well. Will Hunter’s
skin color be the deciding factor on whether he should pursue the attraction or not? Find out this and more in
Book 2 of the Real Love Series, as it continues the ‘love’ journey into the lives of those who will soon
become your favorite beaus.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Garcia:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the publication entitled Second Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2). Try to make the
book Second Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2) as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend
when you sense alone and beside that of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned
for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know everything by the
book. So , let us make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Hoyt Adkins:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new info. When you read a publication you will get new information because book is one of many ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine
the story how the personas do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this Second Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2), you could tells your family, friends as well as
soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a publication.

Nancy Williams:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but also novel and Second Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2) or
others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel desire to read
more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or even students especially. Those guides are helping
them to increase their knowledge. In some other case, beside science book, any other book likes Second
Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like
this one.

James Bouchard:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you
know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update in relation to
something by book. Different categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this
Second Chances (Real Love Series - Book 2).
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