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When Hart Crane's epic poem The Bridge was published in 1930, it was generally judged a failure. Critics
said the poet had unwisely attempted to create a mystical synthesis of modern America out of inadequate
materials. Crane himself, who committed suicide in 1932, did little to correct this impression; and although
the poet's reputation has fluctuated over the past fifty years, many people still find The Bridge unsatisfactory.
In this analysis of Crane's long poem, Paul Giles demonstrates that the author was consciously constructing
his Bridge out of a huge number of puns and paradoxes, most of which have never been noticed by Crane's
readers. Dr Giles shows how Crane was directly influenced by the early work of James Joyce; how the
composition of The Bridge ran parallel to the first serialisation of Finnegans Wake in Paris; and how The
Bridge is the first great work of the 'Revolution of the Word' movement, predating the final published
version of Finnegans Wake by nine years.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Cook:

The book Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature and
Culture) can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave
the best thing like a book Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American
Literature and Culture)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give
many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, you could give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Hart Crane: The
Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature and Culture) has simple shape but you
know: it has great and big function for you. You can seem the enormous world by available and read a book.
So it is very wonderful.

Jennifer Vickery:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With reading you can get a lot
of information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only situation that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write to their book. One of them is this
Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature and Culture).

Rebecca Kurtz:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The
Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature and Culture) which is finding the e-book version. So ,
why not try out this book? Let's observe.

Donna Hubbard:

This Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature and Culture) is
completely new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information since it relief your hunger info.
Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of
digest in reading this Hart Crane: The Contexts of "The Bridge" (Cambridge Studies in American Literature
and Culture) can be the light food for yourself because the information inside that book is easy to get by
anyone. These books produce itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book



application form. People who think that in guide form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this book is the
answer. So there is not any in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It
should be here for you actually. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book sort for your better life as well as
knowledge.
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