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The Book of Mumboo Conteh is a work of fiction. But it could have been a biography. It could have been the
story of any one of the thousands of peaceful Africans who were brutally ripped from their homes and
families and taken to colonial America to serve the lust and greed of their brutal masters. Mumboo’s story is
a story within a story. The main character in Slave Shack is Marcel Wilder. Marcel is a modern day
construction worker who is injured on a job in Atlanta. Although Marcel Wilder and Mumboo Conteh lived
in different centuries, their lives become bound together and inseparable. There is just a bit of the
supernatural here as Marcel is unknowingly guided by the spirit of Mumboo. Mumboo’s tale needs to be told
to the world. But how can a modern day man tell the story of someone who lived two centuries ago? Marcel
finds something; something that changes his life and sends him on an adventure that changes his life forever.
Mumboo’s tale is a tale of brokenhearted romance and suffering. All he wanted was to be with his beloved
Tanna but the brutality of the slavery mentality prohibited it. Although there can never be a true reparation
for the suffering that Mumboo endured at the hands of his captors, perhaps in some way, Marcel can find
peace for Mumboo’s still suffering spirit.
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From reader reviews:

Paula Mendoza:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your condition; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh. Try to face the
book The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh as your good friend. It means that it can to be your
friend when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know almost everything by the
book. So , let us make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Theodore Stewart:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh. You
can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important a book
The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh. You can add know-how and of course you can around the
world by just a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can recognize everything! From your country
until foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In
this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when
you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Melissa Kim:

This The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it
the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information
you will get. This specific The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh without we realize teach the one
who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't be worry The Slave Shack: The Book of
Mumboo Conteh can bring when you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' come to be full
because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even cell phone. This The Slave Shack: The Book of
Mumboo Conteh having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not sense uninterested in
reading.

Stephen Porter:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This book The Slave Shack: The Book of Mumboo Conteh was filled in relation to
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has several feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can feel
enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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